
$1,100,000 - 449 Silver Creek Drive, Somerset
MLS® #25003886

$1,100,000
7 Bedroom, 4.00 Bathroom, 4,494 sqft
Residential on 10 Acres

Silvercreek Est, Somerset, KY

What a Showstopper! Discover the epitome of
luxury living with this immaculate 7BR, 4BA
updated detached home. Spanning three
gorgeous levels, it boasts a serene master
bedroom on the main floor and a fully
equipped in-law suite in the basement with a
walkout leading directly to your private pool.
The pool area is a true tropical oasis,
overlooking a tranquil pond and nestled within
10+/- sprawling acres. Car enthusiasts will
marvel at the property's exceptional garages -
one featuring an 11ft door perfect for housing
a camper, and a larger detached garage
connected by a breezeway with three
climate-controlled bays. One bay is specially
designed with waterproof walls to
accommodate vehicle washing.Perfect for boat
enthusiasts as it is just minutes to the boat
ramp. This property offers endless possibilities
for relaxation, entertainment, and adventure,
yet it's challenging to capture all the incredible
features within this space. Embrace the unique
blend of comfort and elegance in this
unmatched residence. Take the opportunity to
make this spectacular sanctuary your own.
Schedule a showing today and prepare to be
amazed!

Built in 2007

Essential Information

MLS® # 25003886

Price $1,100,000



Bedrooms 7

Bathrooms 4.00

Full Baths 4

Square Footage 4,494

Acres 10.00

Year Built 2007

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Active

Community Information

Address 449 Silver Creek Drive

Area 045 - Pulaski County

Subdivision Silvercreek Est

City Somerset

County Pulaski

State KY

Zip Code 42503

Amenities

View Mountains, Water, Neighborhood

Interior

Heating Heat Pump

Cooling Heat Pump

Stories Two

Exterior

Construction Brick Veneer

Foundation Concrete Perimeter

School Information

District Pulaski County - 45

Elementary Southern

Middle Southern

High Southwestern

Additional Information

Date Listed March 4th, 2025



Listing Details

Listing Office Lake Cumberland Real Estate Professionals
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