
$210,000 - 229 Flatwoods Frozen Camp Road Road, Corbin
MLS® #24018470

$210,000
1 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 360 sqft
Residential on 8 Acres

Rural, Corbin, KY

8 Acres with Rustic Tiny House Near
Flatwoods Boat Ramp! Your Private Hideaway
Awaits! Escape to this serene and private
8-acre property, featuring a charming rustic
tiny house and a spacious garage, just 3 miles
from the Flatwoods Boat Ramp and less than
a mile from Creekside Venue. Whether you're
seeking a peaceful retreat, an investment
opportunity, or a private getaway, this property
has it all!8 Acres of Mixed Terrain: Enjoy a
versatile landscape with a cleared, level area
perfect for building, gardening, or outdoor
activities, surrounded by mostly wooded land
at the back of property that provides privacy
and a natural backdrop. Listing features Rustic
Tiny House: The cozy tiny house exudes
charm with a full-length front porch, ideal for
relaxing and taking in the serene
surroundings. Perfect for weekend escapes
Spacious Garage with Bath: A large garage
offers plenty of storage or workshop space,
complete with a convenient bathroom. Ideal for
car enthusiasts, hobbyists, or extra guest
accommodations. Prime Location: Located just
3 miles from Flatwoods Boat Ramp for easy
lake access and less than a mile from the
popular Creekside Venue and only 5.5 miles to
I 75.

Built in 2021

Essential Information

MLS® # 24018470

Price $210,000



Bedrooms 1

Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 360

Acres 8.30

Year Built 2021

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Contingent

Community Information

Address 229 Flatwoods Frozen Camp Road Road

Area 044 - Laurel County

Subdivision Rural

City Corbin

County Laurel

State KY

Zip Code 40701

Amenities

View Rural, Trees

Interior

Interior Features Bedroom First Floor

Appliances Range

Heating Electric, Zoned, Combination

Cooling Combination, Electric, Zoned

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Features Deck, Porch, Private Road

Construction Log Siding

Foundation Block

School Information

District Laurel County - 44

Elementary Keavy

Middle South Laurel

High South Laurel



Additional Information

Date Listed September 1st, 2024

Listing Details

Listing Office Century 21 Advantage Realty
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